
 

Development Management Committee 
 

Appendix “A” 
 
 
Application No. 
& Date Valid: 
 

23/00169/FULPP 
 

22nd February 2023 
 

Proposal: Erection of multi-storey car park with vehicular access and 
egress from Little Wellington Street following demolition of 
existing Conservative Club building at Aldershot Conservative 
Club  Victoria Road Aldershot Hampshire 
 

Applicant: Shaviram Aldershot Limited 
 
 
Conditions: 
 

 
 
 1 The development hereby permitted shall be begun before 

the expiration of three years from the date of this 
permission.  

  
 Reason - As required by Section 91 of the Town and 

Country Planning Act 1990 as amended by Section 51 of 
the Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004.  

 
 2 The permission hereby granted shall be carried out in 

accordance with the following approved drawings. 
Drawing numbers:- 0001 Rev.P2; 002 Rev.P2;   003 
Rev.P2; 004 Rev.P2; 150 Rev.P7; 151 Rev.P11; 152 
Rev.P9; 153 Rev.P9;   154 Rev.P9; 155 Rev.P9; 156 
Rev.P6; 157 Rev.P8; 158 Rev.P5; & 160 Rev.P2; and  
Planning Statement; Sunlight & Daylight Report; 
Transport Note;   Transport Note#2 : Response to HCC; 
Design & Access Statement; Heritage Statement; Air 
Quality Assessment; Flood Risk Assessment & 
Sustainable Drainage Strategy; Phase 1 Desk Study; 
Preliminary Ecological Appraisal;   Preliminary Bat Roost 
Assessment; Dusk Emergence Bat Survey; Noise Impact 
Assessment; Public Consultation Statement; Additional 
SUDS Maintenance Details/Plan; Klargester Aquatreat 
Details; & Applicants correspondence with Thames 
Water. 

  
 Reason - To ensure the development is implemented in 

accordance with the permission granted. 
  
 3 Construction of the following elements of the 

development hereby approved shall not start until a 
schedule and/or samples of the  materials to be used in 
them have been submitted to, and approved in writing by, 
the Local Planning Authority. Those elements of the 



 

development shall be carried out using the materials so 
approved and thereafter retained:  

 All external wall finishing materials, including structural 
mesh; 

 Roofing and coping materials; 
 Window frames and glazing; 
 Any doors; 
 Ground surfacing materials; 
 Any externally-visible rainwater goods; and 
 Means of enclosure. 
  
 Reason - To ensure satisfactory external appearance.* 
  
 4 No works of construction of the buildings hereby 

approved shall start until plans showing details of the 
existing and proposed ground levels, proposed finished 
floor levels, levels of any paths, drives, garages and 
parking areas and the height of any retaining walls within 
the application site have been submitted to and approved 
in writing by the Local Planning Authority. The 
development shall be completed and retained in 
accordance with the details so approved. 

  
 Reason - To ensure a satisfactory form of development in 

relation to neighbouring property.*   
 
 5 Prior to occupation or use of any part of the development 

hereby approved, details of satisfactory provision for the 
storage and removal of refuse from the premises shall be 
submitted to and approved in writing by the Local 
Planning Authority. The development shall be carried out 
and retained in accordance with the details so approved. 

  
 Reason - To safeguard the amenities of the area.* 
 
 6 Notwithstanding the provisions of the Town and Country 

Planning (General Permitted Development Order) 1995, 
(or any Order revoking and re-enacting that Order), no 
vehicular or pedestrian entrance shall be formed onto a 
highway other than those shown on the approved plans. 

  
 Reason - To prevent adverse impact on traffic and 

parking conditions in the vicinity. 
 
 7 Construction or demolition work of any sort within the 

area covered by the application shall only take place 
between the hours of 0800-1800 on Monday to Fridays 
and 0800-1300 on Saturdays.  No work at all shall take 
place on Sundays and Bank or Statutory Holidays. 

  



 

 Reason - To protect the amenities of neighbouring 
residential properties and to prevent adverse impact on 
traffic and parking conditions in the vicinity. 

 
 8 In the event that unforeseen ground conditions or 

materials which suggest potential or actual contamination 
are revealed at any time during implementation of the 
approved development it must be reported, in writing, 
immediately to the Local Planning Authority.  A 
competent person must undertake a risk assessment and 
assess the level and extent of the problem and, where 
necessary, prepare a report identifying remedial action 
which shall be submitted to and approved in writing by 
the Local Planning Authority before the measures are 
implemented.   

  
 Following completion of measures identified in the 

approved remediation scheme a verification report must 
be prepared and is subject to approval in writing by the 
Local Planning Authority. 

  
 Reason - To ensure that the site is safe for the 

development permitted and in the interests of amenity 
and pollution prevention. 

 
 9 No sound reproduction equipment, conveying messages, 

music, or other sound which is audible outside the 
premises shall be installed on the site. 

  
 Reason - To protect the amenity of neighbouring 

property. 
  
10 All plant and machinery shall be enclosed with 

soundproofing materials and mounted in a way which will 
minimise transmission of structure-borne sound in 
accordance with a scheme to be first submitted to and 
approved in writing by the Local Planning Authority. 

  
  Reason - To protect the amenity of neighbouring 

occupiers.* 
 
11 No use of the development hereby approved shall take 

place until a scheme of  provisions for the control of noise 
emanating from the site has been implemented in 
accordance with details to be first submitted to and 
approved in writing by the Local Planning Authority.  The 
approved scheme installed shall be thereafter retained. 

  
 Reason - To protect the amenity of neighbouring 

occupiers.* 



 

 
12 No development shall begin until a detailed surface water 

drainage scheme for the site, based on the principles 
within the Flood Risk Assessment & Sustainable 
Drainage Strategy by JM Enviro Limited (February 2023) 
and subsequent amended/additional drainage details 
including SUDS Maintenance Plan submitted 7 June 
2023, has been submitted and approved in writing by the 
Local Planning Authority. The submitted details should 
include:- 

 (a) A technical summary highlighting any changes to the 
design from that within the approved Flood Risk 
Assessment; 

 (b) Detailed drainage plans to include type, layout and 
dimensions of drainage features including references to 
link to the drainage calculations; 

 (c) Detailed drainage calculations to demonstrate 
existing runoff rates are not exceeded and there is 
sufficient attenuation for storm events up to and including 
1:100 + climate change; and 

 (d) Maintenance schedules detailing the maintenance 
requirements of all drainage elements within the site. 

  
 Reason - To comply with the requirements of Local Plan 

Policy NE8. * 
 
13 The development hereby permitted shall not be brought 

into use until confirmation has been provided to the Local 
Planning Authority that either:- 1. Foul water capacity 
exists off site to serve the development;  or 2. a 
development and infrastructure phasing plan has been 
agreed with the Local Authority in consultation with 
Thames Water. Where a development and infrastructure 
phasing plan is agreed, no use of the development 
hereby permitted shall take place other than in 
accordance with the agreed development and 
infrastructure phasing plan; or 3. All Foul water network 
upgrades required to accommodate the additional flows 
from the development have been completed.   

  
 Reason - At the request of Thames Water, whom advise 

that network reinforcement works may be required to 
accommodate the proposed development in order to 
avoid flooding and/or potential pollution incidents. * 

 
14 No drainage systems for the infiltration of surface water 

to the ground are permitted other than with the prior 
written consent of the Local Planning Authority. Any 
proposals for such systems must be supported by an 
assessment of the risks to controlled waters. The 



 

development shall be carried out in accordance with the 
approved details. 

  
 Reason - To ensure that the development does not 

contribute to, and is not put at unacceptable risk from or 
adversely affected by, unacceptable levels of water 
pollution caused by mobilised contaminants in line with 
paragraph 170 of the National Planning Policy 
Framework. 

 
15 Piling using penetrative methods shall not be carried out 

other than with the prior written consent of the Local 
Planning Authority.  

  
 Reason - To ensure that the piled foundations do not 

harm groundwater resources in line with paragraph 170 
of the National Planning Policy Framework;and in the 
interests of the amenities of occupiers of adjoining and 
nearby property. 

 
16 no development shall take place, including any works of 

demolition, until a Construction, Traffic & Environmental 
Management Plan has been submitted to, and approved 
in writing by, the Local Planning Authority. The approved 
Plan shall be adhered to throughout the demolition and 
construction period. The Plan shall provide for:- 

  
 (a) the parking of vehicles of site operatives and visitors; 
 (b) loading and unloading of plant and materials; 
 (c) storage of plant and materials used in constructing the 

development; 
 (d) details and location(s) of temporary site 

accommodation; 
 (d) the erection and maintenance of security hoarding 

including decorative displays and facilities for public 
viewing, where appropriate; 

 (e) wheel washing facilities; 
 (f) measures to control the emission of dust, dirt and 

other emissions during construction; 
 (g) a scheme for recycling/disposing of waste resulting 

from demolition and construction works;  
 (h) measures to minimise noise and vibrations during 

construction and demolition; and 
 (i) measures to ensure/maintain vehicular and pedestrian 

access to adjoining and nearby properties at all times 
during the demolition and construction period. 

  
 Reason - In the interests of highway safety & 

convenience and neighbour amenities. * 
 



 

17 No part of the development hereby permitted shall be 
brought into use until details of an appropriate level of 
biodiversity enhancement, including roosting and 
foraging opportunities for urban birds and bat species 
and a sensitive external lighting strategy, shall be 
submitted to, and approved in writing by, the Local 
Planning Authority. Those details and measures so 
approved shall be implemented in full and retained 
thereafter.  

  
 Reason: To ensure that the proposals provide adequate 

biodiversity enhancement relative to the size of the 
development; and to protect and enhance biodiversity in 
accordance with Local Plan Policy NE4 and Paragraph 
175 of the NPPF. * 

 
18 The means of pedestrian, cycle and motor vehicular 

access (including any visibility splays) shown on the 
plans hereby approved shall be constructed and/or 
provided in full accordance with the approved plans and 
retained thereafter at all times for the lifetime of the 
development. The visibility splays so provided shall 
thereafter be kept free at all times of any obstruction 
including trees and shrubs exceeding 1m in height. 

  
 Reason - To improve and maintain visibility for the safety 

of pedestrian and vehicular traffic. 
 
19 Provision shall be made for services to be placed 

underground. No overhead wire or cables or other form of 
overhead servicing shall be placed over or used in the 
development of the application site. 

  
 Reason - In the interests of visual amenity. 
 
20 Details of the Electric Car Charging Points within the 

development shall be submitted to and approved in 
writing by the Local Planning Authority prior to the 
parking spaces in which they would be located being first 
brought into use. The Electric Car Charging Point 
installation so approved shall subsequently be installed 
and made operational and available to users of the 
development prior to the car parking area(s) in which they 
would be located being first brought into use and shall be 
retained thereafter. 

  
 Reason - To reflect the objective of enabling a 

sustainable development. 
 
 



 

21 Prior to first occupation of the development hereby 
approved details of all external lighting to be installed 
within the site and/or on the exterior of the building 
hereby permitted shall be submitted to and approved by 
the local planning authority. The submitted details shall 
indicate the purpose/requirement for the lighting 
proposed and specify the intensity, spread of illumination 
and means of controlling the spread of illumination 
(where appropriate). The external lighting proposals as 
may subsequently be approved shall be implemented 
solely in accordance with the approved details and 
retained thereafter. With the exception of lighting 
identified and agreed as being necessarily required 
solely for maintaining the security of the site/building, no 
other external lighting shall be used/operated during 
night-time hours (2300 to 0700 hours daily) unless 
otherwise first agreed in writing by the local planning 
authority. 

  
 Reason - To ensure no unecessary illumination is used; 

and in the interests of the amenities of occupiers of 
adjoining and nearby properties. 

 
22 Notwithstanding any indication which may have been 

given in the application, or in the absence of such 
information, the development hereby permitted shall not 
be brought into use until full details of the scheme for the 
provision of privacy screening within the development 
have been submitted to and approved in writing by the 
local planning authority. Those means and measures so 
approved shall subsequently be implemented in full prior 
to the first use of the development hereby permitted and 
retained thereafter at all times. 

  
 Reason - In the interests of the amenities of occupiers of 

adjoing and nearby properties. 
 
23 No development shall take place until a Landscape and 

Ecological Management Plan (LEMP), including 
long-term design objectives, management 
responsibilities and maintenance schedules for any 
landscaped areas and/or biodiversity enhanement 
measures has been submitted to, and approved in writing 
by, the Local Planning Authority. The LEMP shall be 
carried out as approved and maintained and retained 
thereafter. any subsequent variations shall be agreed in 
writing by the local planning authority.  

   
 Reason - In the interests of amenity, to ensure the 

protection of wildlife and supporting habitats in line with 



 

National planning policy and Local Plan policies. * 
 
24 In the event that the car park development hereby 

approved is implemented and the 252 parking spaces 
within made available for use, the parking provision to be 
made available with the Galleries re-development 
approved by planning permission 20/00508/FULPP 
dated 6 September 2022 shall be reduced by a 
corresponding 252 parking spaces unless otherwise first 
agreed in writing by the Local Planning Authority.  

  
 Reason - To ensure there is no over-provision of parking 

in the interests of the safety and convenience of highway 
users.    

 
 
 
Application No. 
& Date Valid: 
 

23/00446/FUL 
 

12th June 2023 
 

Proposal: Replacement of windows and doors on both porches and 
replace windows in communal landing and hallway 
at Grazley Lodge Osborne Road Farnborough Hampshire 
 

Applicant: Mr Peter Aldred 
 
 
Conditions: 
 

 
 
 1 The development hereby permitted shall be begun before 

the expiration of three years from the date of this 
permission.  

  
 Reason - As required by Section 91 of the Town and 

Country Planning Act 1990 as amended by Section 51 of 
the Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004.  

 
 2 The permission hereby granted shall be carried out in 

accordance with the following  approved drawings. 
Drawing numbers:-   1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 
14, 15, 16 (Pt1), 16 (P2), 17.  

   
 Reason - To ensure the development is implemented in 

accordance with the permission granted. 
 
 
 
 
 

  



 

Application No. 
& Date Valid: 
 

23/00461/FUL 
 

15th June 2023 
 

Proposal: Extension of the porte cochere, alteration to fenestration 
(including materials), and removal of existing cloister at 
Aldershot Park Crematorium Guildford Road Aldershot 
Hampshire 
 

Applicant: Graham King 
 
Conditions: 
 

 
 1 The development hereby permitted shall be begun before 

the expiration of three years from the date of this 
permission.  

  
 Reason - As required by Section 91 of the Town and 

Country Planning Act 1990 as amended by Section 51 of 
the Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004.  

 
 2 The permission hereby granted shall be carried out in 

accordance with the following approved drawings. 
Drawing numbers:-   

 o XXXX-ARC-00-00-DR-A-000023 S3 
 o XXXX-ARC-00-00-DR-A-000024  S3 
 o XXX-ARC-00-01-DR-A-000025 S3 
 o XXXX-ARC-00-ZZ-DR-A-000026 S3 
 o XXXX-ARC-00-01-DR-A-000027 S3 
 o Preliminary Ecological Appraisal. Aldershot Park 

Crematorium. Aldershot. May 2023.  
 o DeltaSimons Air Quality Assessment. The Park 

Crematorium. June 2023.   
  
 Reason - To ensure the development is implemented in 

accordance with the permission granted 
 
 3 The development shall be carried out in accordance with 

the measures specified within section '6.2.1' and 6.3 of 
the approved 'Preliminary Ecological Appraisal dated 
May 2023'.  

   
 Reason - To ensure that the proposal does not result in 

harm to protected species 
 
 4 Biodiversity enhancements of bird and bat boxes shall be 

installed prior to the first occupation of the building.  
   
 Reason - To ensure that the proposal results in a net gain 

of biodiversity 
 

 
 


